ENC.
April 3, 2007

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA
MATERIALS MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT
101 OLD VENICE ROAD OSPREY, FLORIDA 34229
TELEPHONE (941) 486-2183 + FAX (941) 486-2188

MEMORANDUM

TO: Member s of the School Board
Dr. Gary Norris, Superintendent
Mr. Scott Lempe, Associate Superintendent

FROM: Pat Black, CPPB, Director of Materials Management

TITLE: APPROVAL TO AWARD BID #7069 FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL
EDUCATION UNIFORMS

Bids to provide ‘Middle School Physical Education Uniforms’ were received from nine vendors on
March 13, 2007. The bids of American Apparel Designs, Inc., Designlab, Inc., The Incentive Mall,
and Itchin’to bee Stitchin’, Inc., were the best low bids meeting the advertised specifications based on
asample scenario. Thisbid isfor a period of one year with the option to renew for two additional
one-year periods. The funds for these purchases are contained in the interna accounts of the middie

schools.

“Failureto file aprotest within the time

prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida

Statutes, or failureto post the protest . Not to exceed
Requested by: bond or other security required by law Fiscal | mpact: $50,000.00
Middle School within the time allowed for filing a

) . bond shall constitute awaive of
Athletic Directors proceedings under Chapter 120. Florida
Statutes.”

Posting Date: 3-27-07

Funding: Internal Accounts

Recommended Motion: That the bidsof American Apparel Designs, Inc., Designlab, Inc., The
Incentive Mall, and Itchin’ to bee Stitchin, Inc., to provide ‘Middle School Physical Education
Uniforms’ in an amount not to exceed $50,000.00, be approved for award and purchase.

(over)



THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

UNIFORMS FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL EDUCATION - BID #7069

Bid opened and recorded on March 13, 2007 @ 3:00 p.m.

American _ .
ltem Description Sizes All Seasons Apparel Designs Aquarius Silk Ball & Shoe Sports
Uniforms Inc ’ Screen, Inc. Center
1 |Tee Shirt: Jerzees Heavy 363M or Hanes S-XL $1.75 $1.72 $2.95 no bid
Heavyweight 5280, Ash Gray
No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray and White White $1.50 $1.50 $2.95 no bid
Circle the Brand Bid: Jerzees Heavy 363M or Hanes * both Hanes no bid
Heavyweight 5280
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.00 $1.30 $1.00 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $1.25 $1.50 $1.50 no bid
2 |Tee Shirt: Hanes Heavyweight Fifty-Fifty T 5170, No | Adult S - XL $1.85 $1.78 $2.80 no bid
Sub. Colors: Ash Gray and White Ash Gray
White $1.55 $1.55 $2.80 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.25 $1.30 $1.30 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $1.75 $1.50 $1.90 no bid
3 |Tee Shirt: Hanes Beefy-T 5180, No Sub. Colors: S-XL $3.30 $3.35 $4.95 no bid
Ash Gray and White Ash Gray
White $2.25 $2.15 $4.95 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $2.00 $1.30 $1.25 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $2.75 $1.50 $2.00 no bid
Up charge added to the cost of the shirts above.
4 |Imprinting on shirts, 1-color, 1-side. $1.50 $0.55 $0.70 no bid
5 |Imprinting on shirts, 2-color, 1-side. $1.95 $0.65 $0.95 no bid
6 |Imprinting on shirts, 3-color, 1-side. $2.25 $0.75 $1.10 no bid
7 |Imprinting on shirts, 4-color, 1-side. $2.45 $1.00 $1.35 no bid
8 |Shorts: Soffe M035, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Adult S - XL $4.95 $4.95 $6.20 no bid
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $4.95 * $0.00 $1.05 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $6.95 i $2.50 $2.15 no bid
9 |Shorts: Soffe M036, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Adult S - XL $5.25 $5.29 $6.40 $5.45
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $5.25 * $0 $1.00 $1.50
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $7.35 o $2.50 $2.20 $2.50
10 |Shorts: Soffe B036, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Youth S - L $4.75 $4.39 $5.75 $4.70
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
11 |Shorts: Russell 15714MK, No Sub. Colors: Royal Adult S - XL no bid no bid $6.20 see note
Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL no bid no bid $1.50 no bid
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UNIFORMS FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL EDUCATION - BID #7069

TA

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid opened and recorded on March 13, 2007 @ 3:00 p.m.

Item Description Sizes Designlab, Inc. Embr0|dTr2§ of Sara The Incentive Mall
1 |Tee Shirt: Jerzees Heavy 363M or Hanes S-XL $1.64 $2.22 $2.16
Heavyweight 5280, Ash Gray
No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray and White White $1.64 $1.50 $2.16
Circle the Brand Bid: Jerzees Heavy 363M or Hanes * * Hanes
Heavyweight 5280
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $2.68 i $2.00 $1.20
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $3.18 *x $2.00 $1.50
2 | Tee Shirt: Hanes Heavyweight Fifty-Fifty T 5170, No | Adult S - XL $1.75 $2.22 $2.23
Sub. Colors: Ash Gray and White Ash Gray
White $1.75 $1.53 $2.23
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $3.00 *x $2.00 $1.30
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $3.22 *x $3.00 $1.50
3 | Tee Shirt: Hanes Beefy-T 5180, No Sub. Colors: S- XL $3.12 $3.60 $3.65
Ash Gray and White Ash Gray
White $3.12 $2.50 $3.65
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $4.68 i $2.00 $1.00
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $5.37 *x $2.50 $1.30
Up charge added to the cost of the shirts above.
4 |Imprinting on shirts, 1-color, 1-side. $0.25 $0.95 $0.50
5 |Imprinting on shirts, 2-color, 1-side. $0.50 $1.15 $0.80
6 |Imprinting on shirts, 3-color, 1-side. $0.75 $1.35 $1.10
7 |Imprinting on shirts, 4-color, 1-side. $1.00 $1.49 $1.40
8 |Shorts: Soffe M035, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Adult S - XL $5.25 $4.89 $5.30
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $5.25 * $1.25 $0
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $7.93 % $2.75 $2.25
9 |Shorts: Soffe M036, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Adult S - XL $5.50 $5.35 $5.05
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $5.50 * $1.30 $0
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $8.25 % $2.75 $2.25
10 |Shorts: Soffe B036, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Youth S - L $4.68 $4.45 $4.90
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
11 |Shorts: Russell 15714MK, No Sub. Colors: Royal Adult S - XL $6.37 no bid $5.11
Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $6.88 * no bid $0




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

UNIFORMS FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL EDUCATION - BID #7069

TABULATIO

Bid opened and recorded on March 13, 2007 @ 3:00 p.m.

Item Description Sizes Itc.hm.t? bee Pride Enterprises
Stitchin’, Inc.
1 |Tee Shirt: Jerzees Heavy 363M or Hanes S-XL $1.72 $2.38
Heavyweight 5280, Ash Gray
No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray and White White $1.54 $2.38
Circle the Brand Bid: Jerzees Heavy 363M or Hanes Jerzees Jerzees
Heavyweight 5280
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.50 $3.70
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $1.60 $3.86
2 |Tee Shirt: Hanes Heavyweight Fifty-Fifty T 5170, No | Adult S - XL $1.90 $2.49
Sub. Colors: Ash Gray and White Ash Gray
White $1.52 $2.49
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.55 $4.45
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $1.60 $5.15
3 | Tee Shirt: Hanes Beefy-T 5180, No Sub. Colors: S- XL $3.50 $4.62
Ash Gray and White Ash Gray
White $2.45 $4.62
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.70 $6.35
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $1.70 $7.38
Up charge added to the cost of the shirts above.
4 |Imprinting on shirts, 1-color, 1-side. $0.60 $0.60
5 |Imprinting on shirts, 2-color, 1-side. $0.75 $0.85
6 |Imprinting on shirts, 3-color, 1-side. $0.85 $1.10
7 |Imprinting on shirts, 4-color, 1-side. $1.05 $1.35
8 |Shorts: Soffe M035, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Adult S - XL $4.74 no bid
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.10 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $2.58 no bid
9 |Shorts: Soffe M036, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Adult S - XL $4.98 no bid
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $1.15 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $2.70 no bid
10 |Shorts: Soffe B036, No Sub. Colors: Ash Gray, Youth S - L $4.37 no bid
Royal Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
11 |Shorts: Russell 15714MK, No Sub. Colors: Royal Adult S - XL no bid no bid
Blue, Black, Navy, Purple and Green.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL no bid no bid

3




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

UNIFORMS FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL EDUCATION - BID #7069

Bid opened and recorded on March 13, 2007 @ 3:00 p.m.

American ) .
ltem Description Sizes All Seasons Apparel Designs Aquarius Silk Ball & Shoe Sports
Uniforms Inc ’ Screen, Inc. Center
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL no bid no bid $2.75 $2.50
12 |Shorts: Russell 05214B1, No Sub. Colors: Black, Youth S-L no bid no bid $6.00 $4.70
Green, Navy and Royal.
13 |Shorts: Yale 8772, No Sub. Colors: Black, Purple, | AdultS - XL no bid $6.75 $11.90 no bid
Green, Navy, Royal and Silver Grey.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL no bid $0 $2.00 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL no bid $2.50 $4.00 no bid
14 |Shorts: Yale 8772Y, No Sub. Colors: Black, Navy, | Youth S-M no bid $6.25 $11.45 no bid
Royal and Green.
Up charge added to the cost of the shorts above.
15|Imprinting on shorts, 1-color, 1-side. $1.50 $0.55 $0.70 $0.55
16 |Imprinting on shorts, 2-color, 1-side. $1.95 $0.65 $0.95 $0.80
17 |Set up fee for printing. One time fee. $25.00 per color no charge $25.00 $10.00
Contact Name Jon Wilson Kevin Winkelmeyer Ronald A. Ernst David F. Ruth
Address 3600 Hacienda Blvd., 121 Corporation 5931 Palmer Blvd. 4219 S. Trail
Ste. G Way #C
Davie, FL 33314 Venice, FL 34285 Sarasota, FL 34232 | Sarasota, FL 34231
Phone 954-245-8380 941-488-3770 941-377-3059 941-921-5727
Fax 954-584-3169 941-488-0979 941-377-2264 941-924-0971
Federal ID# 59-1724810 65-1102826 59-1278185
E-mail Jonathan@uniforms kevin@americanapp Ron@aquariussilk Ballandshoe@
andtextiles.com areldegrns.com screen.com earthlink.net
Days to Delivery after receipt of purchase order-calendar days. 15 15 21

*Brand bid is Hanes
5280

**Up-charge on shorts
includes the price of
the shorts.

*#8 No Purple

Add $1.00 additional
print charge for nylon.
Aquarius guarantees
it's prints for the life of
the garment.

*#11 This style short
is now under the
code #42715M0,
15714MK does not
exist.

*#12 This short is
now number
42715BO. Number
05214B1 does not
exist.

Witnessed by: Candy Bellew

Recorded by: Lynn Cox




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

UNIFORMS FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL EDUCATION - BID #7069 Bid opened and recorded on March 13, 2007 @ 3:00 p.m.

TABYEAHON
Item Description Sizes Designlab, Inc. Embr0|dTr2§ of Sara The Incentive Mall
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $7.75 *x no bid $5.62 *x
12 |Shorts: Russell 05214B1, No Sub. Colors: Black, Youth S - | $5.62 no bid $4.90
Green, Navy and Royal.
13 |Shorts: Yale 8772, No Sub. Colors: Black, Purple, | AdultS - XL $8.93 no bid $7.30
Green, Navy, Royal and Silver Grey.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $10.18 % no bid $8.30 %
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL $11.43 * no bid $9.30 o
14 |Shorts: Yale 8772Y, No Sub. Colors: Black, Navy, | YouthS-M $8.35 no bid $7.05
Royal and Green.
Up charge added to the cost of the shorts above.
15 |Imprinting on shorts, 1-color, 1-side. $0.25 $0.95 $0.50
16 |Imprinting on shorts, 2-color, 1-side. $0.50 $1.15 $0.80
17 |Set up fee for printing. One time fee. $0 $50.00 N/A
Contact Name Elizabeth M. Moller Thomas Scholz Kevin Brady
Address 825 Old Airport Rd. 2264 Gulf Gate 5625 Glenn Rd.
Greenville, SC 29607 Sarasota, FL 34231 | Indianapolis, IN 46216
Phone 864-297-7199 941-922-3885 317-541-0569
Fax 864-297-7198 941-922-4009 317-541-0699
Federal ID# 56-2051141 201818410 32-0023621
E-mail Designlab2@aol.com Sara-tee@ kbrady@theincentivemal
embroidme.com ll.com
Days to Delivery after receipt of purchase order-calendar days. 16 14-18 none indicated
*Brand bid is Jerzees *Brand bid is Jerzees |*#11 Number
363M 363M 42715MO
**Up-charge on **Up-charge on shorts
shirts/shorts includes includes the price of
the price of the the shorts.
shirts/shorts.




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

UNIFORMS FOR MIDDLE SCHOOL PHYSICAL EDUCATION - BID #7069 Bid opened and recorded on March 13, 2007 @ 3:00 p.m.
TABULATION
Item Description Sizes Itc.hm.t? bee Pride Enterprises
Stitchin’, Inc.
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL no bid no bid
12 |Shorts: Russell 05214B1, No Sub. Colors: Black, Youth S - | no bid no bid
Green, Navy and Royal.
13 |Shorts: Yale 8772, No Sub. Colors: Black, Purple, | Adult S - XL $6.75 no bid
Green, Navy, Royal and Silver Grey.
Upcharge for| Adult XXL $0.50 no bid
Upcharge for| Adult XXXL not available no bid
14 |Shorts: Yale 8772Y, No Sub. Colors: Black, Navy, Youth S-M $6.50 no bid

Royal and Green.
Up charge added to the cost of the shorts above.

15 | Imprinting on shorts, 1-color, 1-side. $0.60 no bid

16 | Imprinting on shorts, 2-color, 1-side. $0.75 no bid

17 |Set up fee for printing. One time fee. no fee *$10.00

Contact Name Marsha Nash Brian W. Connett

Address 228 Field End St. 12425 28th St. N.
Sarasota, FL 34240 St. Petersburg, FL 33716

Phone 941-378-5694 727-572-1987

Fax 941-377-2953 727-570-3449

Federal ID# 03-0406684 59-2167018

E-mail info@itchinbee.com bids@pride-enterprises.org

Days to Delivery after receipt of purchase order-calendar days. 10-15 21

All prices are each.
*Upcharge added to charge of
cost of shirt above per logo.
PRIDE Enterprises' bid
signatures & pricing are based
upon the separate insurance
levels, certificates, and
statements as well as the
attached additional insured,
indemnification and hold
harmless statements.




