ENC.
November 21, 2006

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA
MATERIALS MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT
101 OLD VENICE ROAD OSPREY, FLORIDA 34229
TELEPHONE (941) 486-2183  « FAX (941) 486-2188

MEMORANDUM

TO: Members of the School Board
Dr. Gary Norris, Superintendent
Mr. Scott Lempe, Associate Superintendent

FROM: Pat Black, CPPB, Director of Materials Management

TITLE: APPROVAL TO AWARD BID #7049 TO PROVIDE FIELD MARKING PAINT

Bids to provide ‘Field Marking Paint’ were received from six vendors on October 25, 2006. The bid
of Venice Paint and Wallpaper was the best low bid meeting the advertised specifications based on a
scenario. This bid is for a period of one year with the option to renew for two additional one-year
periods. The funds for these purchases are contained in the capital budget allocated to the Facilities
Services Department.

“Failure to file a protest within the time
prescribed in Sectlon 120.57(3), Florida Not to exceed
Statutes, or failure to post the protest .

Requested by: bond or other security required by law Fiscal Impact: $50,000.00

within the time allowed for filing a
JOdy Dumas bond shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under Chapter 120. Florida
Statutes.”
Posting Date: 11-14-06 Funding: 1180 Capltal

Evaluated by:
Don Hampton

Lew Mercer

Recommended Motion: That the bid of Venice Paint and Wallpaper, to provide ‘Field Marking
Paint’ in an amount not to exceed $50,000.00, be approved for award and purchase.
(over)




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation for Field Marking Paint - Bid #7049

Bid opened and recorded: October 25, 2006 (Wed.) - 2:00 P.M.

If bidding other than the brands specified below, sample color boards and
complete product specifications, including brand name, product number,
technical data sheets and material safety data sheets (MSDS) should Faitella Enterprises, Inc. PPG Porter Paint
accompany bid. dba The Paint House = Ferguson Waterworks Company
ITEM PAINT # UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY | PICK-UP DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SEYMOUR PAINTS
1 20-644 White, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.78 $34.20 $34.20 $4.27 $4.27
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging:
2 20-652 White, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.28 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
Straight Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging
3 20-646 Yellow, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.78 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *
4 20-647 Red, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.78 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *
5 20-645 |Orange, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.78 $34.20 $34.20 $4.27 $4.27
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *
6 20-648 |Handicap Blue, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.78 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *
7 20-649 |Royal Blue, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.78 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation for Field Marking Paint - Bid #7049

Bid opened and recorded: October 25, 2006 (Wed.) - 2:00 P.M.

If bidding other than the brands specified below, sample color boards and
complete product specifications, including brand name, product number,
technical data sheets and material safety data sheets (MSDS) should

accompany bid.

Sarasota Paint Co., Inc.

Sherwin-Williams Co.

Venice Paint and Wallpaper

ITEM PAINT # UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP UNIT DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SEYMOUR PAINTS
1 20-644  White, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $47.88 $47.88 $3.65 $3.65 $36.95 $37.95
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
. 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
2 20-652 |White, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $2.88 $2.88 $37.95 | $38.95
Straight Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
i 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging
3 20-646 Yellow, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $47.88 $47.88 $3.65 $3.65 $38.95 | $39.95
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
i 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
4 20-647 Red, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $3.65 $3.65 $38.95 | $39.95
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
. 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
5 20-645 Orange, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $3.65 $3.65 $38.95 \ $39.95
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
i 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
6 20-648 |Handicap Blue, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $3.65 $3.65 $38.95 \ $39.95
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
i 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
7 20-649 Royal Blue, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $3.65 $3.65 $38.95 | $39.95
T-Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
. 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation for Field Marking Paint - Bid #7049

Bid opened and recorded: October 25, 2006 (Wed.) - 2:00 P.M.

If bidding other than the brands specified below, sample color boards and
complete product specifications, including brand name, product number,
technical data sheets and material safety data sheets (MSDS) should

Faitella Enterprises, Inc.

PPG Porter Paint

accompany bid. dba The Paint House = Ferguson Waterworks Company
ITEM PAINT # UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PICK-UP | DELIVERY| PICK-UP | DELIVERY | PICK-UP | DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SEYMOUR PAINTS
8 20-668
Fluorescent Green, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.28 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
Straight Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *
9 20-657
Fluorescent Orange, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case No Bid $2.28 $34.20 $34.20 No Bid No Bid
Straight Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: *
RICHARD'S PAINTS
10 8000  |White, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate No Bid $25.90 No Bid No Bid $33.95 $33.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Pittsburg Paint 50-350
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket * 5 Gallons
11 SR-421 Red, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $42.40 NoBid = NoBid NoBid = No Bid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
12 = SR-451 Royal Blue, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $35.85 NoBid = NoBid NoBid = NoBid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
13 | SR-454 Yellow Gold, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $34.78 NoBid = No Bid NoBid = NoBid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
14 = SR-487 Green, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $36.41 NoBid = NoBid NoBid = NoBid

Alternate Brand/Model Bid:

Packaging:

5 gallon bucket *




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation for Field Marking Paint - Bid #7049

Bid opened and recorded: October 25, 2006 (Wed.) - 2:00 P.M.

If bidding other than the brands specified below, sample color boards and
complete product specifications, including brand name, product number,
technical data sheets and material safety data sheets (MSDS) should
accompany bid.

Sarasota Paint Co., Inc.

Sherwin-Williams Co.

Venice Paint and Wallpaper

ITEM PAINT # UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PICK-UP DELIVERY | PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP UNIT DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SEYMOUR PAINTS
8 20-668
Fluorescent Green, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $2.88 $2.88 $38.95 $39.95
Straight Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
. 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
9 20-657
Fluorescent Orange, 18 oz. per can/12 cans per case $39.48 $39.48 $2.88 $2.88 $38.95 $39.95
Straight Tip Alternate Brand/Model Bid: Durastripe
. 18 oz. can/12 cans to case T-Tip
Packaging:
RICHARD'S PAINTS
10 8000 White, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $29.99 $29.99 $30.61 $30.61 $24.95 $25.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2WF902
Packaging: 5 Gallons
11 SR-421 Red, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $48.99  $4899  $57.50  $57.50 $41.95 | $42.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging: 5 Gallons
12 = SR-451 Royal Blue, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $38.99 $38.99 $57.50  $57.50 $33.95 = $34.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging: 5 Gallons
13 = SR-454 Yellow Gold, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $31.99 $31.99 $57.50 = $57.50 $33.95 \ $34.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging:
14 = SR-487 Green, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $38.99 $38.99 $57.50  $57.50 $34.95  $34.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954

Packaging:




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation for Field Marking Paint - Bid #7049

Bid opened and recorded: October 25, 2006 (Wed.) - 2:00 P.M.

If bidding other than the brands specified below, sample color boards and
complete product specifications, including brand name, product number,
technical data sheets and material safety data sheets (MSDS) should

Faitella Enterprises, Inc.

PPG Porter Paint

accompany bid. dba The Paint House = Ferguson Waterworks Company
ITEM PAINT # UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
RICHARD'S PAINTS
15 SR-489 |Purple, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate No Bid $44.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
16 SR-491 Old Gold, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid  $29.99 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
17 SR-492 Black, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $27.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
18 | SR-2064 |Grass Green, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $40.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
19 | SR-2854 |New Maroon, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate NoBid = $40.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate Brand/Model Bid:
Packaging: 5 gallon bucket *
Delivery or completion calendar days after receipt of purchase order: 7-10 5-14 7

Jim Boudreau

Craig Pearce

Tony Edmoundson

Contact:
Address: 706 S. US Hwy 1 6121 Porter Road 4511 Bee Ridge Road
Ft. Pierce, FL 34950 Sarasota, FL 34240 Sarasota, FL 34233
Phone: 800-874-0607 941-379-8989 941-377-4467/345-3361
Fax: 772-465-2751 941-379-3797 941-379-7822
Federal ID: 59-2186877 54-1211771 25-1612585
paintjiim@ craig.pearce tonywe@

E-Mail: bellsouth.net ferguson.com comcast.net

* Seymour - Min. 720
cans @ 1x-mix/match
* Richards - Min. 50
gallons @ 1x-mix/match




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF SARASOTA COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation for Field Marking Paint - Bid #7049

Bid opened and recorded: October 25, 2006 (Wed.) - 2:00 P.M.

If bidding other than the brands specified below, sample color boards and
complete product specifications, including brand name, product number,
technical data sheets and material safety data sheets (MSDS) should
accompany bid.

Sarasota Paint Co., Inc.

Sherwin-Williams Co.

Venice Paint and Wallpaper

ITEM PAINT # UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP UNIT DELIVERY
DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
RICHARD'S PAINTS
15 SR-489 |Purple, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $49.99 $49.99 $57.50 $57.50 $44.95 $45.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging:
16 SR-491 Old Gold, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $36.99  $36.99 $57.50  $57.50 $27.95  $28.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging:
17 ~ SR-492 Black, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $33.99  $33.99 $57.50  $57.50 $26.95  $27.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging:
18 | SR-2064 Grass Green, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $49.99 = $49.99 $57.50 = $57.50 $40.95 . $41.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging:
19 = SR-2854 New Maroon, 5 Gallon Container of Concentrate $46.99 = $46.99 $57.50 = $57.50 $41.95 . $42.95
Alternate Brand/Model Bid: SW B2TF954
Packaging:
Delivery or completion calendar days after receipt of purchase order: 5 7 5-7
David A. Jasik Todd Kreitz Robert S. Crimi
Contact:
Address: 2031 12th Street 501 North Beneva Road 1945 S. Tamiami Trail
Sarasota, FL 34237 Sarasota, FL 34232 Venice, FL 34293
Phone: 941-955-7004 941-812-4508 941-493-0100
Fax: 941-954-3075 941-795-2537 941-497-0636
Federal ID: 65-0225898 34-0526850 59-1498859
david@ swrep6305@ bobcrimi@hotmail.com
E-Mail: sarasotapaint.com sherwin.com

Recorded By: Michelle F. Miller

Witnessed By: Candy Bellew
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